

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	ECONOMICAL JANITORIAL				SUPPLYWORKS				LA OFFICE SUPPLY				MILLENNIUM DISTRIBUTION			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
1	HI-TECH	EJ-015	12/20 NET 19	LOW BID 25.15 .10/OZ	RENOWN	REN05013	12/20oz	33.86 .14/OZ	PrimeSource	75000014\	Cs/12 cans 15.5 OZ/CAN	37.38 cs .20/OZ	ZENEX	495545	12/20OZ/CS	26.25 .11/OZ
2	FRESH BIG D	FRE-3WDS BD-621	PK 10 PK 10	13.73 1.37 ea 11.75 1.18 ea	RENOWN	REN03121	10/BX	13.88 1.39 ea	Boardwalk	GEMHMI	bx/12ea	15.75 bx 1.31 ea SPECS NOT MET	FRESH	WAVE 1.5	EA	LOW BID 1.29
3	BRITE CLOROX	SBC-HCL917 CX-30966	6/1 GL 3/121 OZ	7.89 .0103 oz 9.75 .0269 oz	KIK	11008635042	6/GAL/CS	9.88 .013/oz	KIK	Bleach6	cs/6 gal	10.20 cs/6gl .013/oz				
4	HI-TECH	EJ-100P	DZ	38.10 3.18 ea	RENOWN	REN03997	EACH	SPECS NOT MET 3.65	Boardwalk	926YCT	cs/12ea	69.60 cs/12 5.80 ea	ABCO	00312NB	EA	SPECS NOT MET 5.35
5	ABCO	AB-01210-NB	EACH	2.68	RENOWN	REN02610	EACH	3.02	ABCO	01210NB	each	4.26 ea	ABCO	01210NB	EA	5.9
6	ACS ABCO	ACS-M81165 AB-RM32016	DZ DZ	32.40 2.70 ea 31.08 2.59 ea	RENOWN	REN02248	EACH	SPECS NOT MET 3.75	Bunzl	35771338	cs/12 ea	31.50 cs/12 2.63 ea	ABCO	RM32016	EA	SPECS NOT MET 2.99
7	ACS ABCO	ACS-M81245 AB-RM32024	DZ DZ	45.60 44.40 LOW BID	RENOWN	REN02230	EACH	SPECS NOT MET 3.86	Royal	RB24LR	each	SPECS NOT MET 5.44 ea	ABCO	RM32024	EA	SPECS NOT MET 4.25
8	ACS ABCO	ACS-M80165 AB-CM22016	DZ DZ	30.48 23.95 LOW BID	RENOWN	REN02372	EACH	SPECS NOT MET 2.65	ABCO	CM22016	cs/12 ea	37.16 cs/12	ABCO	CM22016	EA	SPECS NOT MET 2.2
9	ACS ABCO	ACS-M80245 AB-CM22024	DZ DZ	42.12 33.81 LOW BID	RENOWN	REN02228	EACH	SPECS NOT MET 3.5	ABCO	CM22024	cs/12ea	52.33 cs/12	ABCO	CM22024	EA	SPECS NOT MET 3.1
10	CARLISLE	EJ-COMBO35	SET	LOW BID 33.95	APPEAL	APP15500	EACH	35.98	Pinnacle	J100	each	37.77 ea	ABCO	TO1007	EA	37.5
11	3M	3MC-35336	PK 20	10.08 .50 ea	RENOWN	REN02118	20/CS	12.66 .63 ea	3M	426	pk/6	5.76 pk/6 .96 ea	NORTON	JS427	EA	0.61
12	BRILLO	CN-29404	12/10	25.49 .212 ea	BRILLO	PURW240000	10/BX	LOW BID 2.05 .205 ea	ACS	A240000	cs/120	43.10 cs/120 .36 ea				
13	SCA	SCA-TM1616S	96/500	LOW BID 29.75	SCA TISSUE	TM1616S	96/500SH/CS	31.11	Cascades	A2270	cs/96 rls 500 sheets/roll	40.67 cs/96				
14	ATLAS	APM-700	12/1000'	LOW BID 18.70	APPEAL	APP12500-WB	12/1000/CS	19.75	No Bid			No Bid				
15	SOFIDEL	SOF-41013	12/250	WINNER 16.50	RENOWN	REN06001-WB	30/85CT	SPECS NOT MET 18.08	Boardwalk	6274	cs/30 rl 100/roll	SAMPLE NOT SENT 21.10 cs/30 rl				
16	US PUMICE	UP-JAN12	PK 12	LOW BID 19.00	US PUMICE CO	PUMJAN-12	12/BX	20.61	US Pumice	12	dz	21.83 dz				
17	ABCO	AB-02000	EACH	LOW BID 0.47	RENOWN	REN05136	EA	0.49	Better Brush	280412	each	.53 ea	ABCO	2000	EA	0.48
18	HOSPITAL SPECIALTY	HO-08160	12/16	SPECS NOT MET 41.28	RENOWN	REN03020-BD	6/1LB/CS	WINNER 33.93	Fresh Products	614SSBX	bx/6 cans 12 oz per can	SPECS NOT MET 30.11 bx/6				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	ECONOMICAL JANITORIAL				SUPPLYWORKS				LA OFFICE SUPPLY				MILLENNIUM DISTRIBUTION			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
19	HI-TECH	EJ-856	12/20 NET 19	LOW BID 24.49 2.04 ea	APPEAL	APP12735	12/20OZ	34.87 2.91 ea	Chemical U	A1700	ea/ 20 oz	3.56 ea	ZENEX	493930	20OZ CAN	2.15
20	HI-TECH	EJ-872	12/20 NET 14	WINNER 25.58	APPEAL	APP12736	12/20OZ NET 17 OZ	SPECS NOT MET 37.11	Chemical U	A1400	ea/20 oz NET 19 OZ	SPECS NOT MET 3.65 ea	ZENEX	493695	20OZ CAN net 17	SPECS NOT MET 2.2
21	DART	DA-6J6	1000	LOW BID 15.26	RENOVN	REN09011	1000/CS	16.71	Dart	6J6	cs/1000	17.17 cs/1000	DART	6J6	1000/CS	15.6
22	DART	DA-12J12	1000	LOW BID 25.33	RENOVN	REN09006	1000/CS	25.66	Dart	12J12	cs/1000	28.44 cs/1000	DART	12J12	1000/CS	25.8
23	TRADEX	TI-LLG6500	DZ	LOW BID 4.53	RENOVN	REN05241	24/PK	9.24 4.62/dz	AMMEX	LY17L	Pk/12 pair	7.33 pk/12 pr	IMPACT	8448L	DZ	11.15
24	3M NORTON	3MC-35033 NR-80035	PK 5 PK 5	11.19 9.44	RENOVN	REN02023	5/CS	11.71	3M	18052	ct/ 5 pads	\$30.99 ct/5	MERIT		5/CS	LOW BID 8.93
25	3M	3MC-08278	PK 5	LOW BID 52.45	3M	MMM08278	5/CS	52.55	3M	8274	ct/ 5 pads	SAMPLE NOT SENT 36.14 ct/5	MERIT		5/CS	SPECS NOT MET 9.86
26	3M NORTON	3MC-35063 NR-80064	PK 5 PK 5	11.19 9.44	RENOVN	REN02068	5/CS	12.12	3M	8481	ct/ 5 pads	19.89 ct/5	MERIT		5/CS	LOW BID 8.93
27	3M NORTON	3MC-35089 NR-80069	PK 5 PK 5	11.94 10.06	RENOVN	REN02100	5/CS	12.84	3M	20317	ct/ 5 pads	67.80 ct/5	MERIT		5/CS	LOW BID 9.56
28	PALMER	PF-TD0-20101	EACH	44.65	NO BID				KC	9996	each	30.00 ea	VONDREHLE	8864	EA	LOW BID 26
29	RUBBERMAID	RM-FG2531	EACH	4.98	APPEAL	APP18109	EA	LOW BID 4.94	Renown	5125	each	42.94 ea	IMPACT	2602	EA	7.4
30	TRADEX	TI-VMD5201	10/100	16.43	RENOVN	REN05230	1000/CS	22.22	Ammex	LX344100	cs/10bx 100/box	42.60 cs/10bx	C2-HYBRID	8607M		SPECS NOT MET 5/200 17.5
31	TRADEX	TI-LMD6500	DZ	LOW BID 4.53	RENOVN	REN05230	24/PK	9.24 4.62/DZ	Ammex	LY17M	pk/12 pair	7.33 pk/12 pr	IMPACT	8448M	DZ	11.15
32	GREEN KLEAN	GK-5300	PK 10	7.64	RENOVN	REN08050	10/PK	LOW BID 6.75	APC/Janitized	JANWISEN3	SPECS NOT MET ct/100	79.18 ct/100	GREEN KLEAN	GK-5300	10PK/10/CS	77.9 7.79/PK
33	HI-TECH	EJ-CL- 7MADISP	EACH	12.00	APPEAL	APP12706	EACH	12.25	Boardwalk	908	each	18.34 ea	ZENEX	499501	EA	LOW BID 11.5
34	HI-TECH	EJ-MT110 EJ-MT112 EJ-MT116	12/11 NET 7 OZ	LOW BID 27.60 .33/oz	APPEAL	APP12714	12/6.35OZ	LOW BID 25.2 .33/oz	Boardwalk	904	ct/12 cans 5.3 oz	40.33 ct/12 .63/oz	ZENEX	VARIETY	6 oz CAN 12/Case	2.4 .4/oz
35	ABCO	CT08010	EACH	LOW BID 6.95	RENOVN	REN03881	EA	SPECS NOT MET 6.69	ABCO	CT08010	each	Reject- No price Better Brush	ABCO	CT08010	EA	7.1
36	CARLISLE	CSI-36512 UNIVERSAL	PK 10	4.15	RENOVN	REN03882	10/PK	3.18	Better Brush	301104	pk/10	LOW PRICE 2.50 pk/10	IMPACT	3411	10/PK	6.75
37	TOLCO	TOL-280137	PK 12	LOW BID 44.22	RENOVN	REN02097	EA	SPECS NOT MET 5.91	3M	8542	ct/4	SPECS NOT MET 136.44 ct/4	IMPACT	2000	EA	SPECS NOT MET 5.3

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	ECONOMICAL JANITORIAL				SUPPLYWORKS				LA OFFICE SUPPLY				MILLENNIUM DISTRIBUTION			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
38	GEORGIA PACIFIC	GP-59009	EACH	10.74	RENOWN	REN05151-IB	EA	LOW BID 6.86	Boardwalk	JT109SBBW	each	15.95 ea	IMPACT	2539	EA	18.8
39	GREEN KLEAN	GK-5301ER	PK 25	143.95 5.76 EA	NO BID				APC/Janitized	JANWISEN3	ct/100	LOW BID 79.18 ct/100 .79 EA	GREEN KLEAN	GK530122	25/CS	130.4 5.22 EA
40	GEORGIA PACIFIC	GP-59209	EACH	17.19	RENOWN	REN05150-IB	EA	LOW BID 16.5	Boardwalk	JT210SBBW	each	27.42 ea	IMPACT	2529	EA	33.2
41	TRADEX	TI-VSM5201	10/100	16.43	RENOWN	REN05229	1000/CS	22.22	AMMEX	GPX342100	cs/10 bx 100/BX	25.60 cs/10bx	C2-HYBRID		5/200	SPECS NOT MET 17.5
42	LIGHTHOUSE	LHB-6-3PCC00006	PK 1000	26.50	RENOWN	REN09000	1000/CS	LOW BID 24.55 .02 EA	DIXIE	58PATH	cs/2400	60.97 cs/2400 .03 EA				
43	ATLAS	APM-8000	6/800'	15.55	RENOWN	REN06004	6/800'/CS	18.73	GEN	8X800HWTKF	ct/6 rls	19.00 ct/6	VONDREHLE	88012-N	12/800'/CS	LOW BID 27.5 13.75/ 6 ROLLS
44	TOLCO	TOL-110414	EACH	LOW BID 0.32	RENOWN	REN05113	EA	0.42	Boardwalk	58109	ct/24	9.78 ct/24 .41 EA	IMPACT	6900	EA	0.41
45	TOLCO	TOL-120125	EACH	0.40	RENOWN	REN05121	EA	0.44	Boardwalk	32	ct/24	18.17 ct/24 .76 EA	IMPACT	5032WG	EA	0.45
46	TIDI	TP-980912	12/225'	38.77	NO BID				Avalon	513LG	ct/12rolls 18" X 225'	LOW BID 36.72 ct/12				
47	BOBRICK	BOB-270	EACH	24.08	BOBRICK	BOBB-270	EA	LOW BID 21.25	Bobrick	270	each	28.00 ea	IMPACT	1112	EA	39.45
48	HOSPITAL SPECIALTY	HO-KL260	500	11.48 .023 EA	APPEAL	APP18119	500/PK	LOW BID 10.66 .021 EA	Hospesco	260	ct/500	16.52 ct/500 .03 EA	IMPACT	1101	250/PK	18.95 .08 EA
49	ACS	ACS-631	4/5	LOW BID 9.94	RENOWN	REN02108	20/BX	11.75	3M	8005	ct/4 bx 5/bx	34.00 ct/4	NORTON	2211	20/CS	15.95
50	ABCO	AB-01104	EACH	LOW BID 1.89	RENOWN	REN03985	EA	2.51	ABCO	1104	each	3.05 ea	NORTON	32060	EA	3.4
51	HI-TECH	EJ-5093	4/1 GALLONS	LOW BID 13.18 3.30/GAL	MISCO	REN07005	4/GAL/CS	46 11.5/GAL	Chemical U	36004	cs/4 gal	38.50cs/4 9.63/GAL	TRANSGULF	5093	GAL	4.1
52	GUARDIAN	WG040610N	EACH	71.77	SUPERIOR	13046CH	EA	69	Guardian	EG040604	each	DOES MEET SPECS 59.00 ea	GUARDIAN	WG040610	EA	LOW BID 65.91
53	GUARDIAN	WG030510N	EACH	45.44	SUPERIOR	13035CH	EA	SPECS NOT MET 42	Guardian	WG030504	each	46.50 ea	GUARDIAN	WG030510	EA	LOW BID 44.45
54	RUBBERMAID	RM-FG6173	EACH	LOW BID 82.91	RUBBERMAID	617388BK	EA	131.75	Better Brush	154048	each	84.00 ea	IMPACT	6850	EA	106
55	RUBBERMAID	RM-1881749	EACH	LOW BID 98.34	NO BID				Rubbermaid	1881749	each	110.60 ea	IMPACT	193	EA	174
56	RUBBERMAID	RM-FG2655	EACH	40.95	APPEAL	APP15506	EA	47.25	Rubbermaid	265500GY	each	63.25 ea	IMPACT	7755-3	EA	63

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	ECONOMICAL JANITORIAL				SUPPLYWORKS				LA OFFICE SUPPLY				MILLENNIUM DISTRIBUTION			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
57	CONTINENTAL	CN-5550GY	EACH	LOW BID 67.00	NO BID				Rubbermaid	265788GY	each	91.00 ea				
58	RUBBERMAID	RM-FG2632	EACH	LOW BID 13.95	APPEAL	APP15504	EA	17.8	Rubbermaid	263200GY	each	35.00 ea	IMPACT	7732-3		20.6
59	REYNOLDS	RY-7955	6/250'	SPECS NOT MET 26.10	NO BID				Marcal	5016	cc/24 rls	WINNER 37.00 cs/24				
60	ACS	ACS-5096	6/10	9.89 .165 EA	RENOVN	REN02116	15/CS	4.67 .311 EA	Treleione	16021	pk/10 ea	2.32 pk/10 .232 EA	NORTON		EA	0.29
61	DART	DA-12BWWF	1000	31.35	NO BID				DART	12BWWF	cs/1000	LOW BID 28.98 cs/1000	DART	12BWWF	1000/CS	31.52
62	DART PARPAK	DA-5BWWF PAR-21829	1000 2500	28.05 LOW BID 29.78	NO BID				DART	5BWWF	cs/1000	34.00 cs/1000	DART	5BWWF	1000/CS	28.4
63	DART	DA-10CPWF	500	38.85	NO BID				DART	10CPWF	cs/500	47.00 cs/500	DART	10CPWF	500/CS	LOW BID 38.58
64	WALLACE WALLACE	WAL-3540 WAL-7480	1000 1000	5.29 POOR QUALITY 9.85 WINNER	APPEAL	APP20000	1000/CS	POOR QUALITY 5.75	Daxwell	1389	cs/1000	SAMPLES NOT SENT 8.65 cs/1000				
65	WALLACE WALLACE	WAL-3542 WAL-7482	1000 1000	5.29 POOR QUALITY 9.85 WINNER	APPEAL	APP20001	1000/CS	POOR QUALITY 5.75	Daxwell	1390	cs/1000	SAMPLES NOT SENT 8.65 cs/1000				
66	DART	DA-9PRWQR	500	LOW BID 33.48	NO BID				Genpak	LAM79	cs/500	50.12 cs/500	DART	9PRWQR	500/CS	33.52
67	DART/SOLO	SO-075	5000	LOW BID 27.69	NO BID				Genpak	F075	cs/6250	SPECS NOT MET 31.95 cs/6250	DART	075-2050	5000/CS	28.3
68	DART/SOLO	SO-200	5000	LOW BID 38.16	NO BID				Genpak	F200	cs/6250	SPECS NOT MET 45.45 cs/6250	DART	200-2050	5000/CS	39
69	PACTIV	PT-YS200	PK 2400	SPECS NOT MET 22.23	NO BID							No Bid	DART	PLASTIC P200N	2500/CS	WINNER 27.6
70	PACTIV	PT-YLS2FR	PK 2400	SPECS NOT MET 21.00	NO BID							No Bid				
71	DART/SOLO	SO-400	5000	LOW BID 48.64	NO BID				Genpak	F400	cs/5000	71.70 cs/5000	DART	400-2050	5000/CS	49.24
72	REYNOLDS	RY-615M	1000'	21.25	NO BID				Boardwalk	7106	each 18 X 1000	38.00 ea	WESTERN P	281P	ROLL 18 X 1000	26.5
73	REYNOLDS	RY-711	6/5000	SPECS NOT MET 33.20	NO BID				PrimeSource	75000950	cs/12 bx	SPECS NOT MET 49.47 cs/12	WESTERN P	631	12/200SHT/CS	WINNER 33.6
74	REYNOLDS INTEPLAST	RY-916M IG-FSW2402K	2000' 2000'	15.20 WINNER 14.82	NO BID				Boardwalk	7229	each 24 X 2000	20.00 ea	WESTERN P	142	ROLL 24 X 2000	16.98
75	REYNOLDS	RY-RF1011	200	LOW BID 13.20 .066 EA	ELKAY	1GALFR	250/CS	18.32 .073 EA	Interplast	GFRZIPGAL	cs/500	SAMPLE NOT SENT 28.41 cs/500 .057 EA				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	ECONOMICAL JANITORIAL				SUPPLYWORKS				LA OFFICE SUPPLY				MILLENNIUM DISTRIBUTION			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
76	REYNOLDS ELKAY	RY-RF2011 LK-2GALFR	100 100	16.75 13.95 WINNER	ELKAY	2GALFR	100/CS	SAMPLE NOT SENT 13.42	Boardwalk	2GALFXRBAG	cs/100	15.08 cs/100				
77	B & H	BH-B08	500	LOW BID 9.08	NO BID				Ross	8#NAT	bdl/500	11.19 bdl/500	ROSS&WALL	8#	500/PK	10
78	INTEPLAST	IG-GL-LARGE	10/100	3.49	IMPACT	IMP8600L	10/100/BX	8.58	AMMEX	PGLOVE	cs/10 bx 100/BX	48.30 cs/10	C2 HYBRID		5/200/CS	SPECS NOT MET 17.5
79	TRADEX	TI-P2846	10/100	LOW BID 31.69 .032 EA	ELKAY	AP10F2846	100/CS	7.05 .071 EA	AMMEX	PA175	cs/200	28.98 cs/200 .145 EA	REAGON	RTI-PA2846	1000/CS	62.25 .062 EA
80	PACTIV	PT-YTD1-	150	LOW BID 11.00 .073 EA	NO BID				Dart	C90PST3	cs/250	52.11 cs/250 .21 EA	DART	90HT3R	200/CS	LOW BID 14.66 .073 EA
81	DART	DA-12SJ20	500	LOW BID 20.19	NO BID				Dart	12SJ20	cs/500	22.72 cs/500	DART	12SJ20	500/CS	20.5
82	DART	DA-20JL	1000	LOW BID 18.91	NO BID				Dart	20JL	cs/1000	21.35 cs/1000	DART	20JL	1000/CS	19.3
83	DISPOZO	DIS-SSW24-	12,000	30.55	NO BID							No Bid				
84	DESIGN SPECIALTIES	DS-AL-141 CINNABAR	PK 432	WINNER 74.42	NO BID							No Bid	JONES/ZYLON	PPF-7	432/CS	SAMPLE NOT SENT 56.5
85	DESIGN SPECIALTIES	DS-AL-142 CINNABAR	PK 432	WINNER 58.47	NO BID							No Bid	JONES/ZYLON	PPS-6	432/CS	SAMPLE NOT SENT 40.5
86	SQP	SQP-8153	500	LOW BID 12.45	NO BID				Southern	525	cs/500	18.59 cs/500				
87	FISCHER	FPP-602	10/1000	LOW BID 53.19 .005 EA	NO BID				Specialty Pkg.	12132	cs/2000	17.40 cs/2000 .009 EA				
88	ELKAY	LK-HD07	2000	SPECS NOT MET 6.23	ELKAY	HD07	2000/CS	SPECS NOT MET 6.87				No Bid				
89	ACS	ACS-434SPB	DZ	LOW BID 3.19 .266 EA	RENOVN	REN02110	12/CS	15.19 1.27 EA	Royal	S730	ct/144 12/CS	78.57 ct/144 .546 EA	ABCO	SC-SSP200	72/CS	19.9 .276 EA
90	SCA	SCA-6332000	EACH	LOW BID N/C	GP	54510	EA	5.5	Georgia Pacf	54527	each	3.00 ea				
91	SCA SCA	SCA-DX900 SCA-DX906E	6000 6000	35.45 WINNER 34.90	GP	32002	CS 6000	42.39	Georgia Pacf	54550	each	SPECS NOT MET 8.00 ea				
92	PARPAK	PAR-21830	2000	LOW BID 36.30	PARPAK	21830	2000/CS	38.07				No Bid	PAR PAK	21830	2000/CS	37.03
93	PARPAK	PAR-5BB008-	500	LOW BID 29.29	PARPAK	5BB008BK	500/CS	30.73				No Bid	PAR PAK	5BB008BK	500/CS	30.37
94	PARPAK	PAR-21959	1500	LOW BID 52.92	PARPAK	21959	1500/CS	55.51				No Bid	PAR PAK	21959	1500/CS	54.07

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	ECONOMICAL JANITORIAL				SUPPLYWORKS				LA OFFICE SUPPLY				MILLENNIUM DISTRIBUTION			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
95	FABRIKAL	FB-KC90F	1000	SPECS NOT MET 40.05	NO BID				Dart	TP9R	cs/1000	SAMPLE NOT SENT 46.08 cs/1000				
96	FABRIKAL	FB-LKC12/20F	1000	LOW BID 21.55	NO BID				Dart	662TS	cs/1000	33.99 cs/1000				
97	FABRIKAL	FB-DLKC12/	1000	WINNER 30.94	NO BID							No Bid				
98	FABRIKAL	FB-C12	1000	WINNER 30.29	NO BID							No Bid				
99	FABRIKAL	FB-C14	1000	WINNER 30.85	NO BID							No Bid				
100	PACTIV	PT-YS550	5000	SPECS NOT MET 43.63	NO BID				Dart	5C	cs/2500	WINNER 189.00cs.2500				
101	PACTIV	PT-YLS5FR	2500	WINNER 33.85	NO BID							z				
102	ELKAY	LK-7F1015	1000	LOW BID 15.80	ELKAY	BR751014	1000/CS	17.55				No Bid				
103				NO BID	RENOWN	REN06167	EA	WINNER FIRST 200 FREE \$8 EA AFTER				No Bid				
104				NO BID	RENOWN	REN06183	6/1000/CS	WINNER 43.25				No Bid				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS				INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP				PON FOOD				SCHNEIDER PAPER PRODUCTS				BORITEX INC			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
1	CHASE (SPRAYPAK)	433-4104 **12 20oz CANS/CASE**	CASE	31.98 .13/OZ																
2	FRESH	WAVE 2.0 #WDS**10 EA/BX, 6 BX/CASE**	CASE	80.4 1.34 ea																
3									Austin	A-1	6/1 gallon	LOW BID 7.69 .01/oz								
4	RUBBERMAID	FG6381	DOZEN/EACH	LOW BID 37.92 / 3.16																
5	ABCO	01210NB	EACH	LOW BID 2.66																
6	ABCO	RM3216S	DOZEN/EACH	LOW BID 29.88 / 2.49																
7	ABCO	RM3224S	DOZEN/EACH	45.48 / 3.79																
8	ABCO	CM2216S	DOZEN/EACH	29.28 / 2.44																
9	ABCO	CM2224S	DOZEN/EACH	41.88 / 3.49																
10	RUBBERMAID	FG757788YEL	EACH	36.98																
11	HYDRA	70CHD **40/CS**	CASE/EA	LOW BID 19.60 / .49																
12	ACS	ISP01PB **120/CASE**	CASE/EA	SPECS NOT MET 22.80 / .19																
13																				
14																				
15																				
16																				
17	TOLCO	280100	DOZEN/EA	LOW BID 5.64 / .47																
18																				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS				INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP				PON FOOD				SCHNEIDER PAPER PRODUCTS				BORITEX INC			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
19	CHASE (SPRAYPAK)	433-4112 **12 CANS/CASE**	CASE	24.68 2.06 ea																
20	CHASE	438-5152 **19oz CAN, 12 CANS/CASE** NET 18 OZ	CASE	SPECS NOT MET 26.24																
21																				
22																				
23	TRADEX	LLG6500 **12 PAIR/DOZEN**	DOZEN	4.92																
24	TRELEONI	20" GREEN SCRUB **5/CASE**	CASE	10.99																
25	TRELEONI	20" HI-PRO BLACK **5/CASE**	CASE	SAMPLE NOT SENT 15.98																
26	TRELEONI	20" WHITE POLISH **5/CASE**	CASE	10.99																
27	TRELEONI	20" NATURAL HAIR **5/CASE**	CASE	11.79																
28																				
29	RUBBERMAID	FG2531	EACH	5.19																
30	TRADEX	VMD5201 **100/BOX, 10 BX/CASE**	CASE	20.9	S25-Med-VPPG-E	As per sample # 30	1,000/Case	LOW BID 15.75												
31	TRADEX	LMD6500 **12 PAIR/DOZEN**	DOZEN	4.92																
32																				
33	CHASE		1000 EA	12.25																
34	HOSPECO	07908 **METERED, 7oz CAN, 12 CANS/CASE**	CASE	LOW BID 28.06 .33/oz																
35	ABCO	CT08010 **10/CASE**	CASE/EA	71.50 / 7.15																
36	CONTINENTAL	2557 **10/PKG**	PACKAGE	3.19																
37	TOLCO	280157 **12/CASE**	CASE/EA	45.48 / 3.79																

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS				INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP				PON FOOD				SCHNEIDER PAPER PRODUCTS				BORITEX INC			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
38																				
39																				
40																				
41	TRADEX	VSM5201 **100/BOX, 10 BX/CASE**	CASE	20.9	JobGuard/FirstCare-Sm-VPFG-E	As per sample # 41	1,000/Case	15.75												
42																				
43																				
44	IMPACT	4902 (100/CASE)	EACH	0.33																
45	IMPACT	5032WG	EACH	0.37																
46																				
47	CONTINENTAL	250W	EACH	20.19																
48	HOSPECO	KL260 **500/CASE**	CASE	13.27 .03 EA																
49	TRELEONI	02103XX (COLORS: BROWN, BLACK, WHITE or BLUE) **5/BX, 4 BX/CASE**	CASE	10.24																
50	ABCO	01104	EACH	1.98																
51																				
52	CROWN MAT	"SUPER SOAKER" #SS0046	EACH	71.99																
53	CROWN MAT	"SUPER SOAKER" #SS0035	EACH	48.99																
54	RUBBERMAID	617388	EACH	89.98																
55																				
56	RUBBERMAID	2655 **3 EA/CASE...FULL CASES ONLY**	EACH	39.98																

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS				INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP				PON FOOD				SCHNEIDER PAPER PRODUCTS				BORITEX INC			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
57	RUBBERMAID	2657	EACH	98.95																
58	RUBBERMAID	2632 **6 EA/CTN...FULL CARTONS ONLY**	EACH	14.79																
59																				
60	TRELEONI	SO96 **60 EA/CASE**	EACH	LOW BID 0.162																
61																				
62																				
63																				
64								Daxwell	A10001389	1000	5.64	POOR QUALITY								
65								Daxwell	A10001390	1000	5.64	POOR QUALITY								
66																				
67																				
68																				
69																				
70																				
71																				
72								Daxwell	J10003335	18x1000	21.19	LOW BID								
73																				
74																				
75																				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS				INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP				PON FOOD				SCHNEIDER PAPER PRODUCTS				BORITEX INC			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
76																				
77																				
78	TRADEX	PLG6501 **100/BX, 10 BX/CASE**	CASE	4.29	INT-Lrg-PG	As per sample # 78	1,000/Case	3.4												
79	TRADEX	P2846 **100/BX, 10 BX/CASE**	CASE	32.9 .033 EA	INT-2845-DPA	As per sample # 79	400/Case	11.96												
80																				
81																				
82																				
83									Daxwell	C10003502	12,000	29.33								
84																				
85																				
86																				
87																				
88					INT-675675-Hvy	As per sample # 88	6,000/Case	21.84												
89	ACS	434PP **12/PKG**	PACKAGE	3.98 .332 EA																
90																				
91																				
92																				
93																				
94																				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.

LPPS 2017-18 Custodial Supplies Bid Recap

ITEM#	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS				INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP				PON FOOD				SCHNEIDER PAPER PRODUCTS				BORITEX INC			
	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE	BRAND	STOCK #	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT PRICE
95																				
96																				
97																				
98																				
99																				
100																				
101																				
102					INT-1015-XXH	As per sample # 102	1,000/Case	\$28.72												
103																				
104																				

*Items awarded are noted by yellow highlight.